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Thomas Jefferson, a prominent figure in American history, was widely known for
his contributions as one of the Founding Fathers of the United States. He played
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a significant role in shaping the nation's ideals and drafting the Declaration of
Independence. While much is known about Jefferson's political career, few are
aware of his early years and the personal experiences that shaped his character.

The Thomas Fleming Library proudly presents "Young Jefferson," an extensive
collection of resources dedicated to shedding light on the formative years of this
remarkable man. From his childhood in Virginia to his college days at the College
of William & Mary, this library offers an in-depth exploration of Jefferson's early
life and influences.
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Discovering Jefferson's Roots

To better understand the factors that shaped Thomas Jefferson, it is important to
delve into his family background. Jefferson was born on April 13, 1743, in
Shadwell, Virginia. His father, Peter Jefferson, was a successful planter, while his
mother, Jane Randolph Jefferson, hailed from a prominent Virginia family.
Growing up in an affluent household allowed Jefferson access to a quality
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education and an extensive network of influential figures – elements that would
greatly influence his future path.

Formative Years and Pursuit of Knowledge

As a young boy, Jefferson displayed a keen intellectual curiosity. He excelled in
his studies and was tutored by the best teachers of the time. At the age of 16, he
entered the College of William & Mary, where he studied a variety of subjects,
including law, philosophy, and science. This period of his life further fueled his
passion for knowledge and shaped his thinking.

"Young Jefferson" showcases an impressive collection of books and manuscripts
that Jefferson had in his personal library during his teenage years. These
materials provide valuable insights into the young scholar's interests and
intellectual growth. Visitors to the library can examine these texts up close,
retracing the steps of the future leader.

The Influences of Enlightenment

One cannot discuss Thomas Jefferson without mentioning the profound influence
of Enlightenment thinkers on his intellectual development. The Thomas Fleming
Library offers an extensive range of resources on leading philosophers such as
John Locke, Montesquieu, and Voltaire. By exploring these works, visitors can
gain a deeper appreciation for the ideas that heavily influenced Jefferson's
political and philosophical beliefs.

Penning the Declaration of Independence

The crowning achievement of Jefferson's life, the drafting of the Declaration of
Independence, marks a pivotal moment not only in American history but also in
the history of democracy worldwide. The Thomas Fleming Library has



meticulously preserved original copies of early drafts of the Declaration, giving
visitors a chance to witness the evolution of this iconic document.

Exploring Jefferson's Legacy

Jefferson's impact extends far beyond his lifetime. His intellectual contributions,
political philosophy, and dedication to education continue to shape the nation to
this day. The Thomas Fleming Library provides access to a wide range of
resources on Jefferson's later years, including his involvement with the
establishment of the University of Virginia and his influential writings.

The Thomas Fleming Library's "Young Jefferson" collection provides a captivating
journey into the early life of one of America's most significant figures. Through its
engaging exhibits and extensive resources, visitors can gain a deeper
understanding of the personal experiences and intellectual influences that shaped
Thomas Jefferson into the visionary and leader he became. Start your own
exploration of Jefferson's life and legacy at the library today.
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In this swift, insightful book, New York Times bestselling author Thomas Fleming
brings vividly to life the remarkable youth of Thomas Jefferson, one of America's
greatest presidents. Here are all of Jefferson's early triumphs and tragedies -
from his inspired design and construction of Monticello and election as Virginia's
second governor to his achievement as the author of the Declaration of
Independence and the devastating loss of his wife.
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