
The American Puritans: Their Prose And
Poetry
The American Puritans were a group of religious settlers who played a significant
role in shaping the early history of America. Their strict moral code, fervent
religious devotion, and unique way of writing left an indelible imprint on both the
prose and poetry of the time. In this article, we will explore the rich literary
heritage of the American Puritans, examining their distinctive style, themes, and
contributions to American literature.

Understanding the American Puritans

The American Puritans were English Protestants who sought to "purify" the
Church of England from within during the 16th and 17th centuries. Faced with
religious persecution in England, many Puritans relocated to the New World,
primarily settling in the Massachusetts Bay Colony. Their faith emphasized the
absolute sovereignty of God, individual salvation, and a strict adherence to moral
virtue.

Puritan prose and poetry were deeply influenced by their religious beliefs. They
viewed writing as a means of glorifying God and spreading their religious
teachings. Unlike their European counterparts, American Puritans often wrote for
a broader audience, including both educated and less-educated individuals.
Through their writings, they sought to instruct, inspire, and warn readers about
the consequences of straying from the path of righteousness.
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The Style of Puritan Prose

Puritan prose is characterized by its simplicity, clarity, and moral earnestness. It is
free from ornate language and complex literary devices, reflecting the Puritans'
desire for direct communication. Their focus was on delivering their message
effectively rather than showcasing literary prowess.

Puritan prose also often employed extended metaphors and biblical allusions to
convey their ideas. These rhetorical devices helped to make their writing more
relatable and accessible to a wide range of readers. The Puritans aimed to bridge
the gap between the divine and the everyday experiences of their audience,
using vivid imagery to illustrate spiritual truths.

Themes in Puritan Prose and Poetry

The dominant themes in Puritan literature revolved around sin, salvation, divine
providence, and the fragility of human existence. Puritan writers often explored
the moral struggles and temptations faced by individuals in a fallen world. They
emphasized the importance of repentance, personal responsibility, and the
pursuit of a virtuous life.
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Furthermore, Puritan authors frequently wrote about their experiences in the New
World. They depicted encounters with Native Americans, the hardships of
colonization, and their commitment to establishing a God-centered society. These
writings provided invaluable insights into the early challenges and triumphs of
colonial life, offering readers a glimpse of the pioneers' journey and the cultural
clash that ensued.

Well-Known Puritan Writers

Several notable figures emerged as influential Puritan writers during this period.
One such writer was John Winthrop, the first Governor of Massachusetts Bay
Colony, whose sermon "A Model of Christian Charity" introduced the famous
concept of America as a "City upon a Hill." He outlined the Puritan's vision for an
exemplary society based on their religious principles.

Another prominent figure was Anne Bradstreet, considered America's first
published poet. Her poems tackled themes of love, family, faith, and the
challenges of being a female writer in a patriarchal society. Her work, such as "To
My Dear and Loving Husband," demonstrated a nuanced exploration of personal
experiences while maintaining a strong religious foundation.

The Enduring Legacy of Puritan Literature

Puritan literature played a crucial role in laying the foundation for American
literature as we know it today. Their writings provided early examples of American
identity, the exploration of individual conscience, and the pursuit of religious
freedom. The themes and values present in Puritan literature can still be seen in
contemporary American works, which continue to engage with questions of
morality, spirituality, and the human condition.



In , the American Puritans left an indelible mark on the literary landscape of early
America. Their prose and poetry reflected their religious fervor, moralistic outlook,
and the challenges of creating a new society in an untamed land. Today, their
works continue to captivate readers with their introspective exploration of the
human experience and their enduring themes of faith, sin, and redemption.
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Perry Miller was born in Chicago on February 25, 1905. He was educated at the
University of Chicago where he received his Ph.D. degree in 1931. Since then Mr.
Miller taught at Harvard University and in 1946 became a Professor of American
Literature there. He died in 1963.

He was the author of Orthodoxy in Massachusetts (1933); The New England
Mind (1939); Jonathan Edwards (1949); Roger Williams (1953); The Raven and
the Whale (1956); and Errand into the Wilderness (1956).

This anthology is organized as follows:
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