
On Bicycle And Foot Through Greece And
Western Turkey Summer 1984
Traveling on bicycle or foot is a unique way to explore new places, experience
local cultures, and create unforgettable memories. During the summer of 1984, I
embarked on a remarkable journey through Greece and Western Turkey,
discovering the beauty and charm of these magnificent landscapes.

Chasing Adventures

The summer breeze carried the sweet scent of wildflowers as I pedaled my
bicycle through the picturesque landscapes of Greece. The turquoise waters of
the Aegean Sea stretched endlessly before me, inviting me to dive into their
refreshing embrace. With each turn of the pedal, I encountered quaint fishing
villages, ancient ruins, and inviting tavernas bustling with locals.

After exploring the enchanting Greek islands and immersing myself in their rich
history, I decided it was time to continue my adventure. Leaving my bicycle
behind, I embarked on a journey on foot through Western Turkey, where
centuries of civilization were waiting to be discovered.
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Unveiling Historical Splendor

Walking through the vibrant streets of Istanbul, I marveled at the city's remarkable
fusion of cultures, where East met West in a mesmerizing clash of architectural
wonders. From the grandeur of the Hagia Sophia to the majesty of the Topkapi
Palace, history unfolded before my eyes with each step.

Leaving the bustling city behind, I ventured into the idyllic countryside of Turkey,
where ancient ruins whispered tales of long-forgotten civilizations. The awe-
inspiring city of Troy stood tall, revealing the story of the Trojan War that has
captivated the world for centuries. As I explored the intricately preserved ruins of
Ephesus, I could almost hear the echoes of ancient civilizations.

Immersing in Local Cultures

Traveling on foot allowed me to truly immerse myself in the local cultures of
Greece and Western Turkey. The warm hospitality of the Greek people welcomed
me into their homes, where I indulged in delectable Mediterranean cuisine and
danced to traditional Greek music.

In Western Turkey, I was embraced by the spirited atmosphere of bustling
bazaars, where locals traded vibrant spices, intricate carpets, and handcrafted
souvenirs. Conversations with the friendly Turkish people deepened my
understanding of their traditions and way of life.

Discovering Natural Beauty

Both Greece and Western Turkey are blessed with breathtaking natural beauty.
From the rugged cliffs of Santorini, overlooking the azure sea, to the olive groves
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and vineyards of the Peloponnese, each landscape offered a unique and
unforgettable view.

As I trekked through the Samarian Gorge in Crete, I marveled at the
magnificence of nature, surrounded by towering cliffs, crystal-clear streams, and
the songs of birds echoing through the canyon walls. The awe-inspiring
landscapes of Pamukkale, known for its terraces of thermal waters, captivated my
senses.

The summer of 1984 will forever hold a special place in my heart as I traversed
Greece and Western Turkey on bicycle and foot, immersing myself in the
captivating history, vibrant cultures, and breathtaking natural beauty of these
regions. This journey taught me the value of embracing adventure, immersing
oneself in local cultures, and discovering the hidden gems that await those willing
to explore beyond the beaten path.

So, the next time you embark on a journey, consider leaving your comfort zone,
whether it be on bicycle or on foot, and let the open roads and winding paths
guide you to new horizons.
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Changing Gears is the journal of a research-travel odyssey undertaken in eastern
Greece and western Turkey during summer, 1984. Fieldwork was conducted on
the Greek islands of Lesbos, Limnos, and Chios and along the adjacent Turkish
coast from the Dardanelles south to Kusadasi as well as a challenging journey
from the village of Troezen through the mountainous Peloponnesus of
southeastern Greece to Athens, a route traveled by the Greek hero, Theseus.
Included are illustrations and descriptions of ancient Argos, Athens, Corinth,
Eleusis, Epidaurus, Isthmia, Marathon, Megara, Mycenae, Tiryns, and Troezen in
Greece; and Ephesus, Pergamum, Sardis, Smyrna, and Troy in Turkey.
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