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Welcome to the enchanting land of Norway, where breathtaking landscapes and
impeccable beauty await every traveler. In this article, we delve into the
adventures of Janette Norton, an avid traveler who has explored the hidden gems
of Norway. From fjords to mountains, and picturesque villages to vibrant cities,
Norton's journey through Norway is both intriguing and inspiring. So, grab your
backpack and get ready for an exhilarating journey through the captivating
Norwegian landscapes!

Discovering the Magic of Norway

Nestled in the northernmost part of Europe, Norway is a land known for its
dramatic landscapes and picturesque beauty. The country is adorned with rugged
mountains, crystal-clear fjords, cascading waterfalls, and enchanting forests. It is
a paradise for nature lovers, hikers, and adventure enthusiasts who seek a blend
of breathtaking landscapes and thrilling experiences.
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Janette Norton, a seasoned traveler with a penchant for exploration, was
captivated by the allure of Norway. She embarked on a journey to discover the
untouched beauty of the country and unravel its hidden treasures.

The Journey Begins: Exploring the Fjords

Norton's adventure in Norway began with a visit to the majestic fjords. These
deep, narrow inlets carved by glaciers offer a surreal experience. With their
towering cliffs, crystal-clear waters, and cascading waterfalls, the fjords are a
sight to behold.

One of the most stunning fjords that Norton explored was Geirangerfjord.
Surrounded by snow-capped mountains, this UNESCO World Heritage site is a
feast for the eyes. Norton couldn't resist hopping on a boat to see the fjord up
close and marvel at its beauty. The serenity of the fjord left her feeling awe-
inspired and grateful for the opportunity to witness such natural wonders.

Into the Norwegian Wilderness: Hiking and Nature Immersion

For Norton, exploring Norway meant immersing herself in its wild, untouched
nature. She embarked on numerous hiking trails, traversing through dense
forests, crossing babbling streams, and climbing rugged mountains. Norway
offers a vast network of hiking trails suitable for all levels of expertise, making it a
haven for adventure seekers.

One of the highlights of Norton's hiking adventures was the iconic Trolltunga. This
natural rock formation juts out horizontally over a scenic valley, offering
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breathtaking views of the surrounding landscape. The challenging hike to
Trolltunga rewarded Norton with an awe-inspiring vista she will never forget.

But Norway isn't just about mountains and fjords; the country boasts diverse
wildlife as well. Norton had the opportunity to spot reindeer, elk, and even the
elusive Arctic fox during her nature expeditions. The encounters with these
magnificent creatures added an extra layer of wonder to her journey.

Exploring the Vibrant Cities: Oslo and Bergen

While Norway's natural beauty is its main draw, its cities have their own unique
charm. Norton explored the vibrant cities of Oslo and Bergen to experience the
rich history, cultural offerings, and modern amenities.

In Oslo, Norton wandered through the Vigeland Sculpture Park, a must-visit
destination for art enthusiasts. This vast outdoor sculpture museum houses over
200 sculptures created by Gustav Vigeland, showcasing his talent and vision.
Norton found herself mesmerized by the artistic brilliance and the stories behind
each sculpture.

In Bergen, Norton explored the UNESCO-listed Bryggen Wharf, a historic
waterfront district that has retained its charm since the Middle Ages. The colorful
wooden buildings, cobblestone alleyways, and vibrant atmosphere made Norton
feel like she had stepped back in time. Exploring the small boutiques and
enjoying local cuisine in Bergen added a delightful touch to her Norwegian
adventure.

The Northern Lights: A Mystical Dance in the Sky

No trip to Norway is complete without witnessing the mesmerizing Northern
Lights, also known as the Aurora Borealis. Norton was fortunate enough to



experience this magical phenomenon during her visit.

Heading to the northern part of Norway, Norton found herself in the ideal location
to witness the lights dancing across the sky. The vibrant hues of green, purple,
and blue created a breathtaking spectacle that left Norton in awe. It was a
moment she will forever cherish and one that added an ethereal touch to her
adventure.

: Norway, a Land of Endless Adventure

Janette Norton's exploration of Norway unveiled a land of enchantment and
endless adventure. The country's stunning landscapes, from its majestic fjords to
towering mountains, offer unparalleled beauty for every traveler. The vibrant
cities, rich history, and captivating culture add richness to the Norwegian
experience. Whether you're an adrenaline junkie, a nature enthusiast, or a culture
vulture, Norway has something to offer.

So, pack your bags, follow in the footsteps of Janette Norton, and uncover the
hidden gems of Norway. Open your heart to the awe-inspiring beauty that awaits
you in this magical land.
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On an international scale, Oslo is a pretty small capital but, with just over 500,000
people, it's Norway's biggest city by far. More than 10% of the country's total
population lives here; if we count people in the entire Oslofjord area in the
summertime, it amounts to one third of the population in Norway.

What makes Oslo unique is its location. The Oslofjord links the city with the sea
to the south. In the other three directions you find mountains, lakes and forests
within easy reach from the city center. This means that wherever you are in Oslo
you have natural beauty just around the corner. In the winter, you can go from the
shopping areas downtown to the ski slopes in just 20 minutes. The summers offer
even more opportunities as both Marka and the Oslofjord with its islands are
popular destinations for the people of Oslo and its many visitors.

Norway has a population of just over 4½ million people and has one of the lowest
population densities in Europe with 12 people per square km.
Oslo, the capital and biggest city, has more than 500,000 inhabitants and the
Oslofjord area is home to nearly one third of the nation's population if you count
all the summer residents. Bergen is the second-biggest city in Norway with
230,000 people. Trondheim comes in third with 140,000.

Fish is commonly found on dining tables all over Scandinavia, especially along
the coastal areas. In Norway, since 75% of the population lives on or near the
coast, many Norwegians take eating fish on an almost daily basis as much for
granted as eating bread.

The coastline is 2,650 km long and, if you count the fjords, an incredible 25,150
km (nearly 10 times as long). Norway has thousands of islands, large and small,
and, if they are all taken into account as well, the total coastline would be 83,000
km.



The spectacular, scenic fjords are long, deep and usually surrounded by
mountains. Since most of the country's 4½ million people live in urban areas, it
leaves most of the country uninhabited. This makes for abundant wildlife in the
beautiful mountains, forests, lakes, and the famous fjords. Half the country's area
is above the timberline while 25% is covered by forest. The highest mountain,
and the highest peak in Scandinavia, is Mount Galdhøpiggen (8,100 feet), while
the longest fjord is Sognefjorden (126 miles), the longest in the world.

These are just a few excerpts from this detailed guide to every aspect of Norway
for the visitor. Where to dine, where to stay, what to see and do - it's all here. This
information is also included in our much larger Adventure Guide to Scandinavia.
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