
Mastering the Art: How To Act Shakespeare In
21 Days

Do you ever find yourself captivated by the eloquent and poetic language of
William Shakespeare? Have you ever wondered how actors bring these timeless
characters to life on stage? If you've ever dreamt of stepping into the shoes of
Hamlet, Juliet, or Othello, then look no further. In this comprehensive guide, we
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will explore the secrets of acting Shakespeare in just 21 days, using the
renowned book "How To Act Shakespeare" published by Applause Books.

Unleashing Your Inner Bard

Acting Shakespeare can be a daunting task, with its intricate language and
complex emotional depth. However, with the right tools and guidance, anyone
can master the art of Shakespearean acting. "How To Act Shakespeare" by
renowned theater director and teacher Leslie O'Dell is a treasure trove of
techniques and exercises that will help you tap into your inner bard.
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The book is divided into three parts, each focusing on a different aspect of
Shakespearean acting. From understanding the language to embodying the
characters, O'Dell provides step-by-step instructions that are easy to follow, even
for novices.

Unlocking the Poetry

Shakespeare's language is renowned for its rich poetic qualities, but it can also
be a stumbling block for many actors. "How To Act Shakespeare" demystifies the
language by breaking it down into understandable and relatable terms.
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The book teaches you how to scan the lines, identify rhetorical devices, and
navigate through verses effortlessly. Through insightful explanations and practical
exercises, you will develop a deep appreciation for the beauty and complexity of
Shakespearean verse.

Breathing Life into Characters

While understanding the language is crucial, it is equally important to bring the
characters to life. O'Dell understands this challenge and offers invaluable advice
on character analysis and interpretation.

By delving into the historical context, examining the characters' motivations, and
exploring their relationships, you will uncover layers of depth that will enhance
your performance. You will learn to embody the mannerisms, gestures, and
emotions that make Shakespearean characters so memorable.

The 21-Day Challenge

Perhaps the most unique aspect of "How To Act Shakespeare" is the 21-day
challenge. O'Dell has designed a structured program to help actors immerse
themselves in Shakespeare's world within a limited timeframe.

Each day focuses on a specific element, gradually building up your skills and
confidence. From mastering verse speaking to understanding subtext, you will be
amazed at the progress you make in just three weeks.

Learning from the Masters

In addition to O'Dell's expertise, "How To Act Shakespeare" includes valuable
insights from renowned actors who have successfully tackled various
Shakespearean roles. Their personal anecdotes and tips serve as inspiration and
further illuminate the techniques discussed throughout the book.



From Sir Laurence Olivier's portrayal of Richard III to Dame Judi Dench's
mesmerizing Lady Macbeth, you will discover how these acclaimed performers
approach the Bard's works, allowing you to gain a deeper understanding of the
acting process.

The Applause Books Advantage

"How To Act Shakespeare" is proudly published by Applause Books, a leading
publisher of theater and cinema-related titles. With their rich history of providing
valuable resources for actors, directors, and theater enthusiasts, Applause Books
ensures that you are receiving top-quality content that will truly enhance your
Shakespearean acting journey.

Embrace the Challenge, Unleash Your Potential

Theater is an art form that allows us to step into different worlds and explore
various facets of the human experience. Acting Shakespeare amplifies this
experience by immersing us in language that has withstood the test of time.

So, if you've ever dreamed of treading the boards and delivering Shakespeare's
immortal words, don't miss the opportunity to delve into "How To Act
Shakespeare" by Leslie O'Dell. With the comprehensive guidance of this
acclaimed book, you can unlock the secrets of Shakespearean acting in just 21
days.

Prepare yourself for an unforgettable journey that will empower you as an actor,
while enabling you to give justice to Shakespeare's unrivaled works. Your
applause awaits!
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“Actor, director, producer, and teacher Basil (cofounder, American Globe Theatre)
offers a three-week course that demystifies the English playwright and prepares
actors to play Shakespearean roles with confidence. ...his practical instructions
should benefit both students and working actors.” –Library Journal, starred review
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