
Hilarious Tales From The London
Underground And Construction Sites Around
The
London Underground and construction sites are known for their unique and
sometimes absurd experiences. From bizarre encounters to funny anecdotes,
these places can provide endless entertainment for those working or travelling
through them. In this article, we will explore some hilarious tales from the London
Underground and construction sites around the city.

Tale 1: The Singing Construction Worker

It was a typical day at a construction site near the heart of London when
suddenly, amidst the noise of heavy machinery and drilling, a beautiful voice
started to rise above it all. As the workers turned towards the source of the sound,
they were amused to find one of their colleagues, a rough-looking construction
worker, belting out an incredible opera tune. His powerful voice echoed through
the site, captivating everyone who heard it. The unexpected serenade brought joy
and laughter to what would have otherwise been a mundane day.

Tale 2: The Underground Performer's Spectacle

London Underground stations are known for their diverse range of street
performers. One day, as commuters hurriedly made their way through a bustling
station, they were stopped in their tracks by an unusual spectacle. A talented
street performer, dressed as a clown, started juggling bowling balls while riding a
unicycle. The combination of his impressive balancing skills and hilarious
expressions had everyone bursting into laughter. It was a moment of comic relief
in the midst of the rush hour chaos.
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Tale 3: The Talking Ticket Machine

At a London Underground ticket booth, a malfunctioning ticket machine
developed a quirky glitch. Instead of the usual robotic responses, it began
speaking in funny accents and cracking jokes. Passengers were taken aback at
first, but soon found themselves engaged in conversations with the hilarious ticket
machine. People would often gather around the booth just to have a laugh. The
unexpected banter with the malfunctioning machine turned a mundane ticket-
buying experience into a memorable one.

Tale 4: The Ghostly Encounter

London Underground tunnels have always had their share of spooky tales. One
construction worker, working on an extension project, claimed to have
encountered a mischievous ghost deep in the tunnels. As he was digging, tools
and equipment mysteriously moved or disappeared. Strange sounds and eerie
whispers echoed through the empty corridors. Despite the initial fright, the worker
soon adapted to his supernatural companion and began to converse with the
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ghost, sharing jokes and funny stories. The ghostly presence, rather than being
feared, became a source of amusement on those late evenings in the
underground depths.

Tale 5: The "Mind the Gap" Prank

"Mind the Gap" is a widely known phrase heard on the London Underground as a
reminder to be cautious when boarding and disembarking trains. One day,
mischievous pranksters decided to play a hilarious prank at a busy station. They
recorded themselves mimicking the famous announcement, but with a comical
twist. Instead of the usual voice, they used exaggerated accents and funny
phrases, leaving the unsuspecting passengers in fits of laughter. Although the
unconventional announcement momentarily confused some, it added a touch of
humor to the daily commute.

Tale 6: The Dancing Construction Crew

While constructing a new building in the heart of London, the construction crew
decided to inject some fun and laughter into their day. During their lunch breaks,
they would gather for impromptu dance sessions. The sight of burly construction
workers unleashing their hidden dance moves brought sheer delight to onlookers.
Passersby often stopped to join in or simply watch the construction site transform
into a mini dance party. These light-hearted moments added a touch of joy and
camaraderie to an otherwise demanding and serious job.

In , the London Underground and construction sites in the city are not only busy
and chaotic places but also unexpected sources of hilarious and entertaining
experiences. Whether it's a singing construction worker, a funny ticket machine,
or a dance party on a construction site, these tales remind us that laughter can be
found in the most unlikely of places. So, next time you find yourself in the London



Underground or passing by a construction site, keep your eyes and ears open for
an amusing story waiting to unfold.
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Embarrassingly, a number of the reviews for this book seem to involve people
losing control of their bladder

“Anyone who is a bit saucy, very fond of boobies and doesn't mind peeing slightly
when they laugh too hard, this is the book for you!” “I have to admit that I wet
myself twice while reading it but this may in part have been due to my age and a
couple of bottles of a fine St. Emilion,” “Due to the laughter you owe my secretary
one clean pair of knickers.”

Two reviewers have even suggested I should tour as a stand-up comedian

“I found myself laughing out-loud and even sharing segments with my spouse …..
I think Karl could tour as a stand-up comedian,” “Mr Wiggins has views on life that
are expressed in a manner worthy of any stand-up comedian.”
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So my scribblings do seem to raise a smile and a chuckle, and either way you
look at it, that has to be a good thing.

“I got kicked out of bed TWICE for laughing so hard. This is, by far, one of the
funniest books I've yet read”

“I have never, ever read a book that caught me so unawares and made me laugh
so much as Calico Jack. I laughed and laughed so much on the train home that I
had to stop reading it. He is capable of making the reader cry with laughter”

“There were times when I had to set the Kindle down and just laugh out loud.
Some of Mr. Wiggins' thoughts are just hilarious”

Whilst it’s evident that a number of people love my writing - I've even been told by
some that they settle themselves with a cup of coffee before reading my blogs,
Newspaper columns or Facebook posts - I'm very much aware that I have an
inappropriate sense of humour that isn’t to everyone’s taste. In short, not
everyone ‘gets’ me.

Hardly any subject is taboo to the Englishman when he’s laughing, and this often
seems insensitive to other cultures, but the bedrock of the British sense of
humour is a strong sense of sarcasm and self-deprecation. The British can be
very passionate – and if you doubt that try going to a football match - but that
passion is often hidden deep in our humour so that other nationals fail to not only
recognise the deadpan delivery but are never too sure if they’ve been involved in
a serious conversation or just a little bit of friendly banter. Having said that my
style of writing is now appealing more and more to the American market.

This book is not a story, and if you’re looking for a book that is all sweetness and
light, please give this one a miss. It’s not for you. I won’t be offended and I



honestly wish you a great life. If everyone likes me, then I’m not being
controversial enough.

But if you really want to see just how funny the people who travel on the London
Underground can be - even if it's mostly unintentional - and enter the weird and
wonderful of construction for a few minutes, then take a chance on this book

I’ve been told I write with an “easy-going style and a zest for living that is
infectious.” I’m not so sure about that, but I have an opinion on a range of hot
issues, although you don’t have to agree with all my views to enjoy the ride. Other
comments on my writing style warn that I "talk to the reader with all the
confidence of a man in touch with his own reality, in a voice which is seasoned
with a hint of world weariness that is so telling of a writer who has written what he
knows and written it with disarming fearlessness." And that I guess is true.

I can be a handful at times and I know it. I’m strong-willed, a bit outspoken and I
write exactly what I’m thinking. It’s not to everyone’s taste, but this is a book you
can dip in and out of whenever the mood takes you. I hope you enjoy!
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