
100 Things To Do In Omaha Before You Die
Are you planning a visit to Omaha, Nebraska? Well, get ready for an
unforgettable experience! Omaha is a vibrant city with a rich history and a wide
range of activities to indulge in. Whether you're a local or a tourist, there are
countless things to do and see in Omaha. In this article, we'll highlight the top 100
things you must do in Omaha before you die. So buckle up and let's explore the
hidden gems of this beautiful city!

1. Visit the Henry Doorly Zoo and Aquarium

The Henry Doorly Zoo and Aquarium is a must-visit destination in Omaha. It is
consistently ranked as one of the best zoos in the world! With animal exhibits,
interactive experiences, and breathtaking displays, it's a perfect place to spend a
day with your family. Don't forget to check out the Desert Dome, the Lied Jungle,
and the Scott Aquarium.

2. Explore the Old Market District

The Old Market District is a historic area filled with charming cobblestone streets,
unique shops, and excellent dining options. Take a leisurely stroll and soak in the
atmosphere, visit art galleries, and enjoy live entertainment. With its vibrant
ambiance, it's the perfect spot to capture some memorable photos.
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3. Attend a Concert at the Omaha Performing Arts Center

If you're a fan of music, theater, or dance, the Omaha Performing Arts Center is a
must-visit venue. With world-class performances and state-of-the-art facilities,
this center hosts a variety of shows throughout the year. Check their schedule
and catch a performance by your favorite artist or enjoy a Broadway musical.

4. Take a Riverboat Cruise on the Missouri River

Experience the beauty of the Missouri River by taking a riverboat cruise. Enjoy
stunning views of the city's skyline, learn about Omaha's history, and relax as you
float along the river. Whether you opt for a lunch or dinner cruise, it's an excellent
way to unwind and see Omaha from a different perspective.

5. Visit the Durham Museum

The Durham Museum is housed in the historic Union Station and offers a
fascinating glimpse into Omaha's past. Explore the exhibits that showcase the
city's railroad heritage, walk through vintage train cars, and learn about the
pioneers who settled in this region. It's a fantastic opportunity to step back in time
and immerse yourself in Omaha's history.

6. Get Cultured at the Joslyn Art Museum

The Joslyn Art Museum is a cultural gem that houses an extensive collection of
art from various periods, including ancient Greece, medieval Europe, and modern
America. Admire masterpieces by renowned artists such as Monet, Renoir, and
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Georgia O'Keeffe. Don't miss the breathtaking sculpture garden, which offers a
tranquil oasis amidst the city.

7. Explore the Heartland of America Park

The Heartland of America Park is a stunning urban oasis that features a
picturesque lake, beautiful fountains, and lush green spaces. Take a leisurely
walk around the park, have a picnic with your loved ones, and enjoy the
mesmerizing water and light shows that take place in the evenings. It's a perfect
place to relax and connect with nature.

8. Discover the Bob Kerrey Pedestrian Bridge

The Bob Kerrey Pedestrian Bridge is a unique attraction that connects Nebraska
and Iowa. Take a walk or ride a bike across this beautiful bridge that spans over
the Missouri River. Capture breathtaking panoramic views of both states and
enjoy the tranquil ambiance as you explore this architectural marvel.

9. Indulge in Delicious Food at Omaha's Restaurants

Omaha is renowned for its thriving culinary scene. From steakhouses to farm-to-
table eateries, the city offers a diverse range of gastronomic delights. Explore the
local favorite spots and indulge in the mouthwatering Omaha steaks, authentic
Mexican cuisine, or trendy farm-fresh dishes. Your taste buds will thank you!

10. Watch a Game at TD Ameritrade Park

If you're a sports enthusiast, make sure to catch a game at TD Ameritrade Park.
This world-class baseball stadium hosts the College World Series, attracting
baseball fans from all over the country. Cheer on your favorite teams, soak in the
electric atmosphere, and create lasting memories with friends and family.



These are just a few of the incredible experiences waiting for you in Omaha.
From cultural attractions to outdoor adventures, there are countless things to do
in this vibrant city. Whether you're a history buff, a nature lover, or a foodie,
Omaha has something to offer for everyone. So pack your bags, plan your
itinerary, and get ready to create unforgettable memories in the heart of the
Midwest!
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Omaha is often called the best-kept secret in the United States. Once they’ve
been there, visitors tend to fall in love with the city and its people. Omaha is
famous for its great steaks and being the home of Warren Buffett, the billionaire
“Oracle of Omaha.” Referred to as the Gateway to the West, Omaha has so
much to offer, from history, hiking, and an exciting local beer scene to great food.
We take you on a tour of the city’s unique and interesting sites and include some
fun facts and helpful tips. During our travels, we’ll share where to take on the
challenge of eating a six-patty burger with all the toppings, where to find the
home of blown glass art, and where to see some of the fastest planes in the
world. 100 Things to Do in Omaha Before You Die travels around Omaha to
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reveal the beauty and diversity of a growing city. Whether you grew up in Omaha,
call yourself an Omahan now, or are just passing through, this book will make you
stop and say, “I didn’t realize that was in Omaha.”
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